
 Listen, comprehend, analyze, and 
respond creatively to oral, written, 
auditory, and visual information 

 Communicate awareness of how 
diversity and multiple perspectives 
shape and impact individual 
experiences and society as a whole 

 Demonstrate appropriate 
communication for the context 
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 Collect, analyze, evaluate, and 
synthesize relevant information from 
multiple perspectives 

 Apply problem-solving methods in 
appropriate context 

 Think independently, creatively, 
logically, and effectively 

 Demonstrate quantitative competency 
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 Gather and analyze information using 
appropriate modalities 

 Utilize technology effectively and 
responsibly in information acquisition 
and distribution 

 Demonstrate commitment to life-long 
learning 
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 Practice responsible and professional 
conduct in the classroom, workplace, 
community, environment, and digital 
world 

 Demonstrate the ability to work 
independently and collaboratively 

 Exhibit awareness of and appreciation 
for one’s connection to the global 
community 
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ACCJC  COMPETENCIES 

  

MESA  ILOs 

  

Communication competency 

  

Communication 

Information literacy 

Information competency 

  

Communication 

Critical thinking 

Information competency 

Quantitative competency 

  

Critical thinking 

Information competency 

Analytic inquiry skills 

  

Critical thinking 

Information competency 

Ethical reasoning 

  

Critical thinking 

Information competency 

Professional and ethical behavior 

Ability to engage diverse perspectives 

  

Communication 

Critical thinking 

Information literacy 

Professional and ethical behavior 
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